
 

DP3 TOUCHSCREEN UNIVERSAL DASH FIXER FOR UPTO 2015 MOST OBD PLUGIN (185 GBP)

Location North, Northumberland
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-175169-z

DP3 TOUCHSCREEN UNIVERSAL DASH FIXER FOR UPTO 2015 MOST OBD PLUGIN see website for
more details or call 01912170131 - 07572 665270   Highest Quality 100% Stable Digiprog3 - Dp3 Touch
screenOBD Mileage Adjustment Master Programmer and Eeprom Programmer do ANY Car, Van, or
Motorcycle.  Capable of doing the latest models ie 2011 Volvo S80,Freelander 2 is the same and does
the later 2012 onwards too PLUGIN OBD as is Fords, Merc W202, / W212, VW, Audi, Skoda, Seat,
etc,etc, ALL PLUGIN OBD.  1.Just done a Mercedes 204 and 212 diagnosis, mileage and assyst
processing, the tool worked alright. The mileage correction just took less than 1 min.2.Tested on Citroen
c2, okFord Galaxy 04 plate, okFord Mondeo 04, okVW Golf MK 5 06, ok 3.I have tried and tested my DP3
(Digiprog 3) on Mercedes 204 212, worked great. 4.BMW E46 by 20 pin DLC work ok year
2000Mercedes 2008 by OBD work, dash only!Nissan Cascai 2008 by eeprom direct working 5.I did
Mercedes Benz w204 2010, w212 2011. 2 min job done. Worked very good.6.Tested on 211 2008 work
with flashing option(block Syncro with EZS in dash flash)7.2009 Insignia done today via OBD OK2009
Audi R8 done OK2009 Insignia done OK 8.Tested on VW Jetta 2007 and Chevrolet Malibu 2008, OK.9.I
only got the machine this week, the cars I have tried up to now have worked all the eeprom of Audi A4 09
diag, 2011 Ford Focus diag, Peugeot E7 BSI and dash, Fiat Doblo diag, Honda Accord, Peugeot 407 06,
Peugeot 406 bsi and dash.10.Audi a4 2008 …. by obd 30min jobAudi a6 2004…. not from first try but ok
(q7 the same )Audi a3 2003…. obd 1min job  2011 & 2012 zafirar obd 2007 focus OBD Sweet couple
mins2009 VOLVO S80 OBD DONE THE JOB FIRST TIME thanks Newcastle Diagnostics 2007 A4 OBD
PORT2013 Mercedes E-Class W212 Very easy OBD but need reset DPF Values to 0 when finish use
Delphi. what a star for the..
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