
 

ABI Arizona 2004 3 Bed on Northumberland Coast (10,995 GBP)

Location North, Northumberland
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-326106-z

*****Sandy bay Holiday Park, North Seton, Northumberland NE63 9YD***** *****To Book an appointment
to view then call Darren on 07340180074 073401800...(click to reveal full phone number) *****   Sandy
Bay has Commanding spectacular views of the sandy beach from its cliff top setting, this superbly located
park offers everything you need for a fun – filled family holiday in the beautiful north east. Sandy beaches,
Alnwick Castle – the setting for Hogwarts in the Harry Potter films and also home to stunning recently
created gardens, and some of the best walking in England await you in the surrounding area. Children
are well catered for with all the fun and games of their own club, and once the day is over, the Boathouse
Bar is on hand for a quiet drink before settling down to enjoy the sparkling cabaret, shows and dancing on
offer in The Beach Showbar. Historic Morpeth is well worth a visit, bird and seal-watching on Farne Island
and magical Holy Island are all accessible for day trips. Sandy Bay Holiday Park is situated on a
wonderful unspoilt location on the Northumberland coast with stunning cliff top views, a koi carp
ornamental lake and a sandy beach stretching into the distance. There's always something to do indoors
or outdoors with fun activities, a luxury heated indoor pool, an authentic Fish & Chip shop with scintillating
evening entertainment Our amazing facilities at Sandy bay include - Indoor Heated Pool - Water Sports
Programme - Children's Entertainment - Beach Club Bar - Boathouse Bat & Restaurant - Takeaway - Wi-
Fi Access - Darts - Amusements - Children's Adventure Playground - Sports Court - Sorts Resort
Programme - Shop - Laundrette   About Us: Park Resorts have 73 with our merge gorgeous coastal and
lakeside locations – that’s more than any other operator - and a whole host of great facilities, sparkling
entertainment and breathtaking local sights. Plus, Owners also receive exclusive benefits such as
Owners-only events throughout the year, and the chance to get away more often with an extended
season, just for them. Imagine getting away to the coast whenever you like, with no need to queue, book
or even pack! Thousands of people have made this dream a reality with Park Resorts, by snapping up
their own caravan holiday home on the coast. With prices from £9,995 and flexible finance packages, it
may be more affordable than you think, too. Why buy from us? * All our Parks are National Caravan
Council (NCC) approved for Holiday Home Ownership Scheme * We have Caravans Holiday Homes for
sale from as little as £9,995 * We have season lengths at each Holiday Park up to 12 months contact us
for more information * For more information about Ownership visit www.park-resorts
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