
 

Volkswagen Touran 2013 (13,490 GBP)

Location East of England, Essex
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-327068-z

Here we have for sale a 2013 Volkswagen Touran SE TDI in metallic Grey. Basically a bigger Golf, The
Touran is just a more practical, family orientated design with some nice perks in addition. Our Vw Touran
comes with the futuristic park assist mode, the vehicle uses infra red and sensors to navigate its way into
a parallel park, in the process taking full control of the steering wheel adjusting when needed. A surreal
experience indeed. The Touran is an economic diesel averaging a fantastic 55 mpg on average and
stands relatively low down on insurance. Subject to long life servicing every 20,000 miles, the Touran has
only needed one interval service so far with it being done at 15k and an inspection service with ourselves
at 21k. A long advisory free MOT accompanies the vehicle till March 7th 2017. A fantastically conditioned
vehicle. You can also reserve this car for 48 hours with a £150 refundable deposit. We can tailor car
finance around you, we work with some of the top lenders to get you the best rate, no matter what your
credit history. Apply for finance on our website and get a decision in as quick as 30 seconds. As part of
the National Good Garage Scheme, a thorough 50 point check and HPI check is carried out on all our
vehicles. You then have peace of mind with 12 months free break down cover and various Warranty
options that are available. Please check our website for Warranty options and why not try our Part
Exchange Valuation tool?
Immobiliser, Alarm, Traction Control, Central Locking, Remote Central Locking, Power Steering, Air
Conditioning, Electric Windows, Trip Computer, CD Player, Rear Wash/wipe, Electric Mirrors, Roof Rails,
Front Fog Lamps, Parking Sensors, Height Adjustable Seat, Adjustable Steering Column, Multi-function
Steering Wheel, Auto Lighting, Rain-Sensing Wipers, Rear Headrests, Multiple Airbags, Retractable
Headrests, Radio, Privacy Glass, Folding Rear Seats, Head Restraints, Locking Wheel Nuts, Metallic
Paintwork, Colour Coded Body, Cloth Upholstery, Steering Wheel Audio Controls, Isofix, 7 Seater,
Supplied with Warranty, Finance Available, Part Exchange

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

 
V

olksw
agen 

T
ouran 

2013

https://w
w

w
.freeadsz.co.uk/x-3270

68-z

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

                               1 / 1

https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-327068-z
http://www.tcpdf.org

