
 

Luxury 26x12 Static Caravan for sale on Hayling Island (35,274.15 GBP)

Location South West, Hampshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-409155-z

This holiday home is located on Hayling Island, on the south coast in Hampshire. Surrounded by
beaches, a fun fair, lovely local cafes and restaurants, ice cream parlours and cycle tracks. A great little
place to get away for the weekend. Driving over that bridge makes you feel like you’re on holiday, Its on
a island but without fuss of ferry travel. Hayling is known for its windsurfing so if you’re into your water
sports then you’ll enjoy it here on Hayling Island. Central to both Portsmouth and Chichester, so if you
fancy a trip back in time to Portsmouth’s historic dockyards or you want to splash the cash in Gunwharf
Quays shopping outlets then you’re only a short journey away. In Chichester, a lovely place, with a lot of
historic culture and art. There is plenty to do, whether it be shopping, sporting activities or even to grab a
bite to eat, it’s a nice day out for all of the family. A little further down the road you have west wittering’s
some beautiful sandy beaches.   On Hayling Island Holiday Park we have; Heated indoor swimming pool
Heated outdoor swimming pool Live show bar Restaurant and sports bar Indoor play area Outdoor play
park Gym Arcade Big munch takeaway Convenience store Launderette This 36x12 2 bedroom caravan
will sleep up to 6 people comfortably. It is fully double glazed and centrally heated. It has an open plan
with a light wood finish. The living area has fixed benched seating therefore it is very spacious. This
caravan also has a fixed benched dining area. This caravan has a gulley kitchen which is fully equipped
with a fridge/freezer and a gas oven/grill. A hallway leading to the main bedroom with plenty of cupboard
space and an on suite toilet, a twin bedroom and also a shower room with a full sized shower and toilet.
Finance available from 10% deposit, subject to status, written details on request. For more information
about the park or if you would like you view this holiday home then please contact Jake on 07854514731
078545147...(click to reveal full phone) .
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