
 

Anti-wrinkle treatments, Dermal fillers, Medical Skin Peels, Microdermabrasion

Location North, Cheshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-411564-z

Anti-wrinkle Treatment Botulinum Toxin A (BOTOX®) is widely known and widely used.  This can be used
in the facial muscles and allow wrinkles to be relaxed by restricting movement in the facial muscles. It is
very safe to use and has been used for over 30 years for other medical conditions including
blepharospasm and muscle spasticity. It has been approved for cosmetic use by the FDA and MHRA. It is
a prescription only medication and therefore needs to be prescribed to you by our pharmacist
independent prescriber during your initial consultation. â€‹ Treatment areas include: Glabella lines
(between eyes) Forehead Crow's feet (side of eyes) Dermal Fillers & Lip Augmentation There are many
dermal fillers on the market and the few leading brands have got the most clinical safety data and efficacy
data.  The dermal fillers we use at Smooth&Flawless are synthesised from hyaluronic acid, which is
globally the most popular type of dermal fillers. Hyaluronic acid is also used medically for joint pain, and
medical aesthetic applications. It is also supported in the collagen skin matrix.  The component is slowly
absorbed over time as the molecules that are present in the fillers mimic the natural compounds found in
the collagen of the skin.   The collagen in the skin over time reduces, causing the drooping effect and the
developing of folds and creases.  The dermal fillers allow this to be restored to its natural self by
temporarily increasing the collagen production in the skin, allowing the skin to become firmer and
volumised. â€‹ Treatment areas include: Lips to provide definition and/or volume Peri-oral lines (around
the mouth area) Naso-labial lines (nose to mouth lines) Marionette lines (mouth to chin lines) Sleep lines
Can be used in combination with Botulinum Toxin A (BOTOX®) for deeper lines Medical Grade Skin
Peels (Agera®) The medical skin peels provided can be used to treat ageing skin, acne, scarring and
hyperpigmentation. Unlike conventional facials, these skin peels penetrate into the skin, remove the dead
skin cells to encourage the stimulation of collagen and elastin to rejuvenate the skin for a more youthful,
brighter appearance. Acne is also targeted as the peels block pores and redness caused by acne, whilst
they reduce hyperpigmentation by restoring an even skin tone. The AGERA® skin peels will provide
immediate visible results and will not result in skin shedding or redness. Clients can choose to have 1
treatment or a course of 2 or 3 treatments, each 7-14 days apart. Maintenance treatment is
recommended 3-4 months after initial treatment.    The initial stages of the treatment will involve cleansing
of the skin. It is advised that clients wear no makeup for this treatment. The practitioner will then use a
prepping solution to prepare the skin for the peel. The peel is applied to the skin and is activated by the
application of cold water. Clients may choose to add a microdermabrasion treatment into the peel
treatment.   The type of treatment you will receive will depend on the outcome of your consultation. The
peels that are provided by Smooth&Flawless are listed below:   Pro C Peel System - delivers a high level
of L-Ascorbic acid, provides the benefits of a peel with low irritation, helps enhance the dermal matrix Pro
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SLC Peel-24 - Produces a low level of irritation, contains high levels of salicylic acid and is a keratinolytic,
helps provide anti-acne benefits Pro SLC Peel-40 - 40% concentration, helps provide anti-acne benefits,
hyperpigmentation, fine line and wrinkles To maintain the effects of the peels, clients can purchase
AGERA® skincare products specific to suit their needs. Microdermabrasion Medical microdermabrasion
is a way of rejuvenating the skin in a non-surgical way, without the use of chemicals or laser but with the
use of mechanical skin exfoliation.  The treatment can be used in many areas of the body including the
face, the neck, the chest and the back to restore great looking skin.  It helps with: â€‹ Blackheads
Whiteheads Facial lines and wrinkles Acne prone skin Scars Excessive oily or dry skin   BOOK NOW to
have a free consultation to find out how we can enhance the way you look and.
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