
 

2 , 4 , and 5  berth caravans for hire for glastonbury  F1 silverstone  2017  thurs to sunday deals 140 (140 GBP)

Location East of England, Hertfordshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-426938-z

2 and 4 berth caravans for hire F1 special deal Thursday to Sunday, price shown is for a 4 days rental
only £140 for self towing (book for 2017 now)  caravans for hire   this is for hire only, not for sale self drive
or have it delivered, --- if you need it delivered then there will be a fee special deals if it is booked for long-
term, w/ends or for holidays,, festivals ,/ rallies, / horse show events, / air shows, / security companies, /
event organizers, / easter w/ends, / bank holiday w/ends, Either great for holidays or on your drive way to
have an extra bedroom when friends stay at xmas or easter or bank holidays, caravan will be clean when
collected or delivered, if it is returned dirty then £40 will be taken from your deposit,, if anything is broken
or missing when returned then a fee will be taken from your deposit,, Rates are from £35 per day ,, min 3
days, (discount after 3 days ) in the  c/vans are as follows key safes are fitted so no worry about losing
your key to the c/van, hot and cold water for shower gas or electric heater, kettle, pots and pans, plates,
mugs all supplied, oven, gas hob and a fridge with small freezer department, -------------a small freezer
can be hired , see below for hire price, special rates for a longer hire are as follows, weekend special
rates. Bank holidays Friday to Monday only £140. with £25. deposit (4 days) 5 days will be £165 should
be £175,,  /  £25 Deposit to be added, ,7 days will be £195. should be £245,, / £25 Deposit to be added
14 days will be £385 should be £490,, / £25 Deposit to be added all deposits are to be paid on the day of
the booking ,, payment on day you come to collect or when delivered  can be paid  with paypal / cash/ or
by credit card pls note that all deposits are non refundable  all you need to supply is your bedding and
towels and of course your food,,, extra for hire,, --- Full size awning £55, / Awning inner double bedroom
£35,, / Table top freezer £40,, / small generator £55,,  /   Table with 4 chairs £30  /  recliner sun chairs £10
each ,     if any of the keys to the van is lost while with you then a £15  fee will be taken from your deposit,
for more info contact Lee at Bletchley caravan hire on 07481891698 074818916...(click to reveal full
phone number)   or   email  click to contact go to   www.bletchleycaravansforhire
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