
 

Luxury Lodge that stands out from the crowd - Thorness Bay Cowes Isle of Wight Hampshire South Coast (99,995 GBP)

Location South West, Isle Of Wight
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-430047-z

Stunning Lodge For Sale  Wessex Deckhouse, 4 Berth, (2008)  PRICE: £99,995 Finance Options
Available, Subject to Status, Written Details on Request From 10% Deposit  Make: Wessex  Model:
Deckhouse  Berth: 4  Reg Year: 2008  Condition: Pre owned  Length: 42  Width: 20  his Stunning holiday
home lodge is sited on a stunning development at Thorness bay on the beautiful Isle Of Wight. The lodge
has some stunning sea and country views and comes with a large decking. at an impressive 20 feet wide
and 40 foot long. The deckhouse has two sets of double doors at the front of the home which leads out on
to the veranda where you can enjoy watching the boats in the Solent. Inside the lodge you will notice the
high vaulted ceilings, and lots of windows which allow tons of natural light in to the open plan lounge and
dining area. The lounge has 2 large comfortable sofas and a cream carpet, it also boasts a large flat
screen television. The dining area is ideal for entertaining guests, it has a large oak table with 6 beautiful
chairs matching the stunning oak wood laminate floor. At the very front of the Lodge is the stunning
spacious kitchen which has many useful appliances, it has a large free standing stainless steel
fridge/freezer, dishwasher and even a washer/dryer! The main focal point of this stunning kitchen is of
course the beautiful stainless steel Gas Range Master cooker. The kitchen is finished to a very high
standard and has some beautiful and well places lighting to accent its best features. As you walk out of
the kitchen, through the double glass doors onto the huge decking area you can see the Solent in all its
glory. This is the perfect placement for your summer entertainment and to catch the rays of the Isle of
Wight Sunshine with cool drink. To the rear of the Lodge you pass through gorgeous oak framed glass
doors and enter a spacious hallway, On the right you have a full size bath, wc and basin, then out of the
bathroom you enter the twin room, with large 3ft single beds and a large oriental style sliding door
wardrobe. The main bedroom has a large king-size bed, and again the large sliding door wardrobes, this
room even has an en-suite with matching twin basins and a large shower which has a wet room effect.
The Wessex deckhouse is a stunning holiday home and can be enjoyed by all. The price of the home
includes all 2016 Site Fees, Stunning Large Decking with Sea and Country Views, Private Parking for 2
Vehicles and also full use of the parks facilities, indoor heated pool with flume, sea view restaurant which
over looks the parks own bay, entertainment venue and outside play area, laundrette and shop. Located
between the Isle of Wight's most affluent yachting areas, Yarmouth and Cowes. Close to the Ferry ports
surrounded by stunning scenery and the islands attractions and treasures for all the family. This Holiday
Home yields some outstanding sublet income to help towards the running costs! Viewings by appointment
only
Monday and Fridays
Call or text Salena 07583114381 075831143...(click to reveal full phone)
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