
 

Mercedes-Benz SLK 2014 (19,995 GBP)

Location East of England, Suffolk
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-457455-z

We are delighted to offer for sale one of only two SLK's currently available in the UK with bespoke quilted
leather upholstery! First registered in September 2014 on a 64 reg this immaculate Mercedes SLK 250
CDi AMG Sport BlueEfficiency Roadster 7 speed Automatic is finished in a truly stunning colour
combination of Polar White with Exclusive Amaretto quilted bespoke leather upholstery. A lovely example
having had just one lady owner from new with the added benefit of a full Mercedes manufacturers
warranty valid until September 2017 as well as having full service history, totalling two service visits
carried out at 13k and very recently at 26k. Exclusive quilted Amaretto leather upholstery with detailed
black stitching, vario glass roof, multi stage heated seats, Becker Map Pilot Satellite Navigation
preparation, Audio 20 stereo with integrated 6 cd changer, DAB digital tuner, USB storage and Bluetooth
audio. AMG Styling Package, AMG Sports Package, Sports Suspension, 18 inch AMG alloy wheels, LED
running lights, Bluetooth telephone, fully adjustable Sports seats, 3 spoke Sports multi function leather
steering wheel with paddle shift controls, Eco start stop function, 7G-Tronic Plus 7 speed Automatic
gearbox with Economy, Sport, tiptronic and paddle shift options. Auto lights, cruise control, tyre pressure
monitoring system, Pedestrian Protection, automatic child seat recognition, multi function display, 2x keys
and a full book pack. A fabulous example finished in a truly stunning colour combination, viewing is highly
recommended. The Lanmere Motor Company is a family run business based in Colchester. We pride
ourselves on supplying handpicked, great value, fully prepared vehicles at highly competitive prices. HPi
checked. Competitive finance options available, subject to status. Extended national RAC parts and
labour warranty available for added peace of mind. Part exchange welcome. No hidden fees or admin
charges. Buy with confidence. Viewing by appointment only.
Cruise Control, Full Leather, Heated Seats, Sports Seats, Multi-function Steering Wheel, Auto Lighting,
DAB Tuner, Sports Suspension, 6 cd Changer, LED Running Lights, 7 speed Auto, AMG Sports
Package, AMG Styling Package, Bluetooth Audio, Sat Nav prep, AMG Sport model, Glass Roof,
Exclusive Quilted
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