
 

42quot Panasonic HD-ready LED TV (249 GBP)

Location South East, Berkshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-459818-z

42" Panasonic HD-ready LED TV in excellent condition, with original packaging and remote

 Originally paid £375. Selling for £249 (more than 33% off), open to other offers

 Cash on pick-up only
 --------------------------------------
Panasonic B6 Series HD-ready LED - Direct-lit LED delivering amazing brightness, clarity and colour
detail
 Panasonic B6 Series TVs feature a highly efficient LED-backlit IPS LCD panel for vibrant image quality,
even when viewed at an angle.

 Panasonic B6 Series HD-ready LED televisions combine outstanding image quality with unbeatable
value for money. These good-looking LED TVs are available in 32" (81cm), 39" (99cm), 42" (107cm) and
50" (127cm) screen sizes, ensuring there's a TV perfectly proportioned for every room in the house, and
feature Freeview HD, integrated USB media playback plus a high quality V-Audio sound system.

Slim design and energy efficient
 All B6 Series LED TVs are highly energy efficient, thanks to new panel technology which reduces power
consumption without harming image quality.

 The contemporary slim design of the B6 Series is easy to accommodate, whatever your décor. The
televisions also feature an advanced LCD panel design which makes them extremely energy efficient. An
ambient sensor monitors light levels in your living room and adjusts the image accordingly, while an Eco
Navigation mode allows for simple adjustment of a variety of energy saving functions.

Freeview HD tuner
 An integrated Freeview HD tuner offers over 100 TV and radio services, including four HD channels,
without the need for any additional subscriptions or service contracts.

Superior image quality
 Panasonic B6 Series LED TVs use high-quality IPS LCD panels & Freeview HD tuners. B6 Series LED
TVs deliver a high contrast image with vivid colour reproduction. The HD ready IPS panel guarantees
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rich, contrasty pictures with a 178 degree viewing angle.

Clear stereo audio
 Delivering clear dynamic stereo sound, your B6 Series LED TV features powerful 2 X 10W full range
speakers. Panasonic V-audio processing provides an enlarged stereo soundstage.

HDMI inputs
 With two HDMI inputs, B6 Series LED TVs can be easily connected to other HD home entertainment
equipment, including set top boxes and Blu-ray/DVD disc players. One HDMI connection is ARC (Audio
Return Channel) enabled, making it simple to connect to a soundbar or surround sound system.

Additional connectivity
 In addition to twin HDMI inputs, B6 Series LED TVs also feature an optical digital audio output, which can
be used with compatible surround sound audio systems, along with SCART and component video inputs,
plus a CI common Interface slot. If you have music, video or JPEG files you want to enjoy on the big
screen, there's a USB v2.0 media reader too, compatible with all popular file formats.

VIERA Link
 B6 Series LED TVs provide easy-to-use system control. You can command various HDMI devices
connected to your TV using the standard Panasonic IR TV control, all thanks to VIERA Link.
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