
 

SMALLFIELD FURampFEATHER AUCTION (1 GBP)

Location South East, Surrey
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-482803-z

NEXT 3 FUR & FEATHER SALES ARE: 1ST JAN, 5TH FEB, 5TH MAR, Doors open at 10am for the
public birds please be early as they tend to go with in the first hour. To book a Table Call 07825870509
078258705...(click to reveal full phone number) or email click to contact. Traders 9am to set up onwards.
10am start at Centenary Hall, Wheelers Lane, Smallfield RH6 9PT. Further Info and Bookings Call 07825
870 509 07825 870 5...(click to reveal full phone number) or click to contact Table Hire £4.00 Entry £1.50
Refreshments Served. NEXT 3 FUR & FEATHER SALES ARE: 22ND jAN, 26TH FEB, 26TH MAR, Doors
open to the public at 2:30pm & to Traders at 1:30pm. There will be NO INCREASE in pitch or Entry Fees.
NEW Monthly Raffle,LOTS  Prizes to be won, Bird see, Mite spray, Bird Baths & More..... Thank you for
your continued support for the last year, and lets keep it going by coming along, its a fun and friendly
afternoom/ Morning out for the family where you can get help advice, have a natter or Just come for some
homemade Cake. See you there!  The sales run on the 1st Sunday morning from 10am until 1pm, each
month. Tea & Coffee's Provided for a small charge. To book a table call 07825870509 078258705...(click
to reveal full phone number) , table hire is £3, entry is £1 email click to contact Breeders and Traders are
welcomed; Table hire is £3 per Table you are requested to and book in advance. Entry to the venue on
the day is £1, under 16 Free. We also have another Bird Sale on Sunday the 22nd March at the
Shoreham Centre Brighton. BN43 5WU Starts at 2pm Traders 1pm. Bulk seeds will be sold to order only,
Nest boxes, birds of all types Canaries, Cockatiels, Budgerigars, Quails, Parrots, and many more.
Centenary Hall, Wheelers Lane, Smallfields, Horley RH6 9PT 07825870509 078258705...(click to reveal
full phone number) For further information and a list of other venues and confirmed dates visit
www.crestedbudgerigars
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