
 

BLUE STAFFORDSHIRE BULL TERRIER (1,250 GBP)

Location Yorkshire and the Humber, West Yorkshire
https://www.freeadsz.co.uk/x-484216-z

THIS LITTER SIRE IS THE ONE AND ONLY BLUE BOUNCER (best blue in the U.K.) AND THE
DEPOSIT BOOK IS NOW OPEN... These fantastic pups are bred from the best, dad being THE BLUE
BOUNCER he holds 30 champions in his 5 generation pedigree and he passes 13 champions to his pups
and the bitches dad being VALGLO NEPTUNE he holds 28 champions in his 5 generation pedigree and
he passes 14 champions onto his pups these are the 2 best Blue dogs in the U.K just check them
yourself with the kennel club. We are proud and excited to confirm that our high quality litter is due on the
14/01/2017. These pups will all come exceptional high quality thick boned pups with tiny muzzles,
excellent stops and broad define bully heads. Sired by the UK TOP DOG THE BLUE BOUNCER standing
at 14 inches he is one of the shortest and stockiest dogs you will find in the UK, coming from the very
best black and blue show lines this country has to offer fully health tested L2HGA-HC clear he has 0
faults, deep chest, thick bone structure, excellent top line, short muzzle, define large bully head, perfect
scissor bite, perfect rose bud ears and every single nail is black, the BLUE BOUNCER not only has the
looks and correct pigmentation but also the pedigree to back it up and most importantly he has the dark
brown eyes that a staffy is supposed to have. Dam to the litter is the daughter of (VALGLO NEPTUNE)
and she is one of the best example of a blue staff you will find anywhere in the U.K genuine quality
standing at 14 inches with a tiny muzzle short stocky with perfect pigmentation black nose and black nails
and dark brown eyes chizzled cheek bones and tiny perfect rose bud ears and lots of muscle in short she
is AMAZING and has the most loving and gentle nature great with children you will not find a better nanny
dog than this bitch anywhere in the U.K. In this carefully planned out mating parents to these pups have
this is a truly wonderful pedigree and one of particularly high quality in the BLUE type Staffordshire Bull
terrier AND YOUR COMBINING TWO OF THE VERY BEST EXAMPLES OF BLUE STAFF IN THE UK
ALL INTO ONE PUP. Pups will come to you very well socialised with other dogs and young children and
with sound temperament including in the sale will be KC papers 4 weeks free insurance nails clipped fully
wormed microchipped diet recommendations and a life time of help and support if required if you have
any more questions please do not hesitate to get in touch if you are interested in being a custodian of this
line please contact me on the number below or leave me a message. We have already sold some of
these pups so we advise you put down your holding deposit as soon as possible which is £200 NON
REFUNDABLE OVER 18 ONLY PLEASE £1250 girl or boy if no white
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